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CME Submission 08-172. 

Dear Mr. Stawick: 

Chicago Mercantile Exchange Inc. ("CME~ or "Exchange") hereby certifies with the 
Commission rule amendments to standardize its FX Fixing Price procedures by 
implementing the current 2:00 PM FX fixing price I settlement price procedures to the 
calculation of the 9:00 AM FX fixing prices, which are used for exercise of the European-style 
FX options at expiration (Appendix 1 summarizes the new 9:00 AM FX fixing price 
procedures). The Exchange certifies that these rule amendments to selected options on 
currency chapters comply with the Commodity Exchange Act and the rules thereunder. Also, 
the volume analysis supporting this action, suggested CME Group could now expand its 
European-style FX options offerings by launching European-style Options on Australian 
Dollar Futures contracts (see under separate cover, CME Submission #08-173 dated 
November 6, 2008, for exchange certification and rules for listing European-style Australian 
Dollar Options on Futures). CME Group intends to implement these enhancements to the 
9:00AM FX fixing prices starting Monday, December 15, 2008. Appendix 2 presents the rule 
revisions necessary to adopt the 2:00 PM fixing procedures for the 9:00 AM FX fixing prices 
with deletions bracketed and overstruck, and additions underlined. Appendix 3 is a clean 
copy of these rules. 

Earlier this year, CME Group submitted for certification, several enhancements to the FX 
options product line. 1 The Exchange has intended to standardize the FX fixing price 
procedures by adopting the preferred 2:00 PM methodology for 9:00 AM at such time that it 
was feasible. The principal difference between the two procedures lies in the length of the 
interval over which the VWAP is calculated (as noted previously, Appendix 1 details the new 
9:00 AM FX fixing price procedures). The 2:00 PM FX Fixing I Settlement Prices are 
sampled over a 30-second interval. The 9:00 AM FX Fixings are calculated over a 2-minute 
interval. As long as the underlying futures markets are liquid and deep enough to dissuade 
manipulation, market participants prefer fixing prices determined as close to the hour as 
practicable. 

Over-the-counter ("OTC~) FX option exercises are marked exactly to the 10:00 AM Eastern 
time (9:00AM Central time) spot FX rates. The longer the CME Group FX futures fixing 
price calculation interval; the more potential for deviation from the OTC FX option 
benchmark. When CME Group's European-style FX options were first launched in 2005 and 
expanded in 2006, a two-minute VWAP calculation at 9:00 AM was considered to be a 
reasonable interval for specifying the volume-weighted average price for determining which 
expiring options are in the money and exercised. However, since that time, CME Group FX 

1 Including elimination the "pin risk" by forced exercise of expiring, in-the-money American-style FX options and the 30-second volume­
weighted average price (VWAP) of underlying FX futures to determine which options were in and out of the money (also used as the 
nearby futures daily settlement price). 
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volumes in the underlying futures contracts have increased generally and now CME Group 
staff has access to CME Globex depth of book data for additional analysis. CME Group 
believes these historical data suggest that a 30-second VWAP calculation can now be used 
for the 9:00 AM FX fixings. Data from a 30-second interval are displayed in the left-hand 
"Tier 1" section of Appendix 4 in the column labeled "VWAP" (Appendix 4 is attached 
separately). In addition to looking at simulated settlement prices, the analysis also calculated 
numbers of trades (Tier 1 "Ords" in Appendix 4) and volumes at these selected time intervals 
as well (30-second results displayed in "Tier 1" section of Appendix 4 in the column labeled 
"Qty") . 

. There were only two instances for all six underlying FX futures across sixteen consecutive 
monthly expirations, where there were less than 3 trades during the proposed 30-second 
interval preceding 9:00 AM (exceptions were Australian dollar futures on August 8, 2008, 
where there was 1 trade and February 8, 2008, where there were 2 trades). In the situation 
of no trades, then the average of the CME Globex bid/ask spread midpoints are referenced 
for the FX fixing prices. For all of the six major FX futures contracts, there were CME Globex 
bid I ask prices available to reference a Tier 2 calculation for each of the last 16 monthly 
European-style FX options expirations. Further, Appendix 4 presents depth of CME Globex 
book data (5 levels deep with volumes indicated on the bid and ask) as well as summary 
statistics for number of orders and volumes of trading during the target 30 second interval. 

CME Group believes that these statistics show that there is availability of standing bid and 
ask pricing to back up calculations of the 9:00 AM FX fixings, when the requisite Tier 1 trades 
are not met. For example, Appendix 4 shows that for Australian dollar futures sited above on 
Friday, August 8, 2008, in order to move the CME FX fixing price three ticks, on the bid side, 
a trader would have to hit the bids for 20 contracts and on the offer side,. would have to lift 
the offer on 38 contracts. Similarly, on Friday, February 8, 2008, a trader would have to hit 
the bid for 21 contracts and lift the offer on 27 contracts to move the market three ticks. Also, 
adding Euro-style exercise Australian dollar options is very likely to result in increased 
futures trading in the 30-second interval prior to the 9:00AM expiry, and thus further improve 
the reliability of the VWAP calculation in this currency. CME Group believes that these 
statistics demonstrate the viability of the new 9:00 AM FX fixing price procedures. 
Respectively, the following Tables 1 and 2 summarize selected data appearing in Appendix 4 
for (1) numbers of trades (orders) and (2) volumes trades during the 30-second interval 
ending at 9:00 AM. 

Members/shareholders will be notified of these new 9:00 AM FX fixing price procedures and 
the associated rule amendments in CME Group Special Executive Report, S-4785, dated 
Monday, November 10, 2008. 

CME certifies that these changes comply with the Commodity Exchange Act and regulations 
thereunder. 
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If you require any additional information regarding this action, please do not hesitate to 
contact Steve Youngren, at 312-930-4583 or via e-mail at Steve.Youngren@cmegroup.com 
or me at (312) 648-5422. Please reference our CME Submission #08-172 in any related 
correspondence. 

Sincerely, 

Is/ Stephen M. Szarmack 
Director and Associate General Counsel 
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Table 1. Summary of Numbers of Trades (Orders) at 30-Second Interval Ending at 9:00AM 

*Data for underlying FX futures on past 16 monthly FX options termination dates. 

Sources: Armada Database and CME Group Equity, FX & Alternative Investments Research 
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Appendix 1 

New 9:00 AM FX Fixing Price Procedures Summarized 

1. "CME currency fixing price" calculation interval is 30 seconds (8:59:30 to 8:59:59) 

2. Tier 1: Volume-Weighted Average Price (VWAP) of underlying futures contract traded on 
CME Globex is calculated and disseminated on a real time basis during the 30-second 
interval ending at 9:00 AM. However, if less than three trades by the end of the interval, then 
go to Tier 2 for the CME Globex bid/ask data (therefore, for 2, 1 or zero trades in 30-second 
calculation interval, then Tier 2 applies). 

3. Tier 2: Calculate the midpoint of the bid/ask spread during the 30 seconds on a real time 
basis. Sample at least once per second (minimum of 30 observations). CME FX fixing price 
is the average of the midpoints. For liquid contracts, most of the time fixing prices will be 
determined via the Tier 1 procedures. If no bid/ask spreads are available during the 30-
second interval, then Tier 3 applies. 

4. Tier 3: Use over-the-counter (OTC) vendor contributed spot rates and forward points to 
calculate synthetic futures "CME currency fixing prices." If there are no sales or bid and ask 
prices during the 30-second interval preceding 9:00 AM at the expiration of a European-style 
FX option contract, then Exchange staff will derive the CME currency fixing price as a 
synthetic futures price from quote vendor spot rates and appropriate maturity forward points. 
The price will be displayed on Merquote and the CME Website. 
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Appendix2 

Approved Rule Amendments to Adopt the Current 2:00 PM CME FX Fixing Price I 
Settlement Price Procedures for the 9:00 AM FX Fixing Price Procedures for Options on 
Selected FX Futures. 

Chapter 251A 
Options on British Pound Sterling Futures 

Rules 251AOO through 251A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

251A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out-of­
the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether an 
option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from [pit­
IFa!le!l aR!I] GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the [t\•o'e FRiRI:IIe] 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume [•...,l:!er:e availallle,] from 
[!!:58 te Q:QQ) 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If less than three or no sales (trades) occurred during the [twe FRiRYie) 30-second interval noted above, take the 
midpoint of each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the [l>...,e FRiRYie] 30-
second interval. [Fiawe¥er, 't.'l:!eR laakiRg at easl:! IIi!! i ask sprea!l, if it is wi!ler tl:!aR a spesilie!l RYFRIIer af paiRts 
{iRpl:ltte!l 'lariallle, e.g., 3 paiRts far "'1:1ra, e paiRts far 9ritisl:! paYR!I, eta.), tl:!eR igRar:e tl:!at a'leFage IIi!! & ask pair 
iR tl:!e sals~:~latiaR.] 

Tier 3 [If Ra .sales {tra!les) aR!I Ra IIi!! aR!I ask prises ass~:~rra!l liiYriRg tl:!e twa FRiRYie iRterval, tl:!eR take tl:!e li'le FRiRYte 
a'leFage af sale {tra!le) prises, 'lteigl:!te!l lly 'JaiYFRe 'ltl:!ere a•.•ailallle, fFeFR !!:55 te Q:QQ a.FR. GeRtral liFRe. 

Tier 4 If Ra sales {tra!les) ass~:~rre!l !l~:~riR!J tl:!e li'le FRiRYte iRtePo<al Rate!! alla•Je, take tl:!e FRi!lpaiRt af easl:! IIi!! & ask 
spr:ea!l wl:!ere a•.-ailallle aR!I a'/eFage tl:!e res1:1lliRg FRi!lpaiRts a¥er tl:!e !i•Je FRiRI:Ite iRterval. Flawe'ler, wl:!eR 
laakiRg at easl:! ·IIi!! I ask sprea!l, if it is wi!ler tl:!aR a spesilie!l RI:IFRIIer af paiRts {iRpl:lttelil 'Jariallle, e.g., 3 paiRts 
far "'1:1ra, e paiRts far Elritisl:! pai:IR!I), tl:!eR igRare tl:!at a· .. erage IIi!! & asl( pair iR tl:!e sals~:~latiaR. 

Tier-a] If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the [li'<'e FRiRI:Ite] 30-second interval, then 
Exchange staff shall [take iRte saRsi!leratiaR aRy atl:!er iRfaFFRatiaR it !leeFRs apprapriate te !leteFFRiRe tl:!e GM"' 
61:1rreRsy !i*iR!J prise far tl:!at !lay. Tl:!is iRfaFFRatiaR FRay iRsl~:~de. ll1:1t is Rat liFRite!l ta tl:!e fallawiRg, aR!I tl:!e 
prase!l~:~res te !leteFFRiRe tl:!e iRfaFFRatiaR FRay lie perfaFFRe!l iR aRy ar!ler lly "'*sl=laRge staff: {1) repeat tl:!e steps 
!lessrille!l iR Tiers 3 ar 4 at e~·er iRsreasiRg !i'le FRiRYte iRsreFReRts {e.g., iRtePo•als af 19, 15, 2Q, eta. FRiRYtes) 
I:IRtil !lata is alltaiRe!l; {2) derive the CME currency fixing price (as a synthetic futures price}[s) from quote vendor 
spot rates and appropriate maturity forward points[; aR!I {3) set tl:!e GM"' s~:~rreRsy !iMiRg jlrise 1:1siRg aRy etl:!er 
iRfeFFRatiaR ar FRetl:!a!l !leeFRed apprapriate]. 

The caloulation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to [&) ;1 shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fixing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 

Chapter 252A 
Options on Canadian Dollar Futures 

Rules 252AOO through 252A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

252A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
[pit tFa!le!l aR!I) GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the [a•.•e FRiRI:Ite] 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume [wl:!ere a•~ailallle,] from 
[!!:58 te Q:QQ] 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 
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Tier 2 If less than three or no sales (trades) occurred during the [twa A'liRYte] 30-second interval noted above, take the 
midpoint of each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the [twa A'liRYte] 3D­
second interval. [Fiew~Wer, wi'leA leekiRg at easl'l biEI .'ask spreaEI, if it is wilier tRaR a spesifieEI RYA'Iber ef peiRis 
(iRpYtteEI •;ariable, e.g., 3 peiRts fer eYre, e peiRts fer 8ritisR peYREI, ets.), tReR igRere !Rat a•Jerage biEI & ask pair 
iR IRe salsYiatieR.] 

Tier 3 [If Re sales (IFaEies) aREI Re biEI aREI ask prises essyrreEI EIYriRg IRe 1\ve A'liRYte iRterval, tReR take IRe five A'liRYte 
a•Jerage ef sale (traEie) prises, weigRteEI by 'JBIYA'IB wRere available, ffel!'l !1:55 te 9:QQ a.A'I. CeRtral tiA'Ie. 

Tier 4 If Re sales (traEies) essYrreEI EIYriRg IRe five A'liAYie iRterval ReteEI abe\re, take IRe A'!iEipeiRt ef easR biEI & ask 
spreaEI wRere available aREI a•.•erage IRe resyltiRg A'liEipeiRts e•Jer IRe five A'liRYie iRterval. l=le• .. Jever, wReR 
leakiRg at aasR biEI .' asiE spreaEI, if it is wilier tRaR a spesifieEI RYA'Iber ef paiR!s (iRpYtteEI •Jariabla, e.g., 3 paiRts 
fer eYre, e peiRts fer 8ritisR paYREI), tRaR igRare IRat average biEI & ask pair iR IRa salsYialiaR. 

Ti&F-a] If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the [fi•Je A'liRYte] 30-second interval, then 
Exchange staff shall [taiEa iRte saRsiEieratiaR aRy aiAar iRferA'IatiaR it Elaal!'ls apprapriata te EleteFA'IiRa tRa CMe 
SYFF9RSY filliRg prise fer !Rat Elay. TRis iRfeFA'!aliaR A'lay iRSIYEia. bYI is RBI liA'IileEI te IRa fellawiRg, aREI IRe 
preseEIYres Ia EleteFA'IiRe IRe iRfeFA'IatieR A'lay be perfaFA'IeEI iR aRy arEier by exsRaRge staft:: (1) repeat tl'le steps 
ElessribeEI iR Tiers 3 ar 4 at EWer iRsreasiRg fiiJe A'liRYte iRsrel!'leRts (e.g., iRtervals ef 1Q, 15, ~g. ate. A'liAYies) 
YA!il Elata is abtaiAeEI; (2) derive the CME currency fixing orice (as a synthetic futures price}[s] from quote vendor 
spot rates and appropriate maturity forward points[; aREI (3) set IRe CMe sYrreRsy filliRS prise YSiAS aAy atRer 
iRfeFA'IatiaA ar A'latRaEI EleeA'IeEI apprepriate]. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to [&] ~ shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fixing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 

Chapter 253A 
Options on Japanese Yen Futures 

Rules 253AOO through 253A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

253A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
[pit traEieEI aAEI]GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the [l'""a A'liRY!e] 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume [wRare availaele,] from 
[!1:5!1 ta 9:QQ]8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central time on the day of determination of. the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If less than three or no sales (trades) occurred during the [1\va A'liRYie] 30-second interval noted above, take the 
midpoint of each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the [twa A'liRYte] 30-
second interval. [l=la• .... e•;er, wReA laakiRS at easR eiEI I ask spreaEI, if it is wiEier !RaR a spesifieEI AYA'Iber af paiR!s 
(iRpYtteEI variaele, e.g., 3 paiRts fer eYre, e paiAts far 8ritisR paYAEI, ate.), theA igRare tRat average biEI & ask pair 
iA IRe salsYialiaA.] 

Tier 3 [If Ra sales (traEies) aREI Ra biEI aAEI ask prises assYrreEI EIYriRS IRe 1\\re A'liRYte iRierval, tReR take IRe fi•.•a A'liAYie 
a•~erase af sale (traEie) prises, weigRteEI by •JaiYA'IB wRere a\•ailaele, ffel!'l !1:55 Ia 9:QQ a.A'I. CeRiralliA'Ie. 

Tier 4 If Ra sales (traEies) assYrreEI EIYriRS IR.e five A'liRYte iR!erval ReteEI aba•;e, take IRe A'liEipaiRI af easR eiEI & ask 
spreaEI wRere a•Jailable aAEI average IRe resyltiRS A'liEipaiRts a•Jer IRe five A'liRYte iRierval. l=lawever, WRBR 
laakiRS at easR eiEI .' ask spreaEI, if it is •,•JiEier tRaR a spesifieEI RYA'IBBF ef paiAis (iRpYtteEI variable, e.g., 3 paiRis 
fer eYre, e paiRts fer 8ritisR paYAEI), IReR igRare !Rat average eiEI & ask pair iA IRe salsYiatiaR. 

Ti&F-a] If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the [five A'liRYte] 30-second interval, then 
Exchange staff shall [take iAta saRsiEieratiaA aAy a!Rer iRfeFA'IatiaR it Eleal!'ls apprepriate ta ElataFA'IiRa tRe CMe 
SYFF9RSY filliRS prise fer !Rat Elay. TRis iRfeFA'IaliaR A'lay iRSIYEie. bYI is RBI liA'IiteEI Ia IRe fellewiR§, aREI IRe 
preseEIYres te EleteFA'IiRa IRe iRfeFA'IatiaR A'lay ee perfeFA'IeEI iR aRy erEiar by exsRaRga staft:: (1) repeat tRe steps 
ElessribeEI iR Tiers 3 er 4 at ever iRsreasiRS five A'liRYie iRsrel!'leRts (e.g., iRtervals ef 1Q, 15, 2Q, ets. A'liRY!es) 
YRtil Elata is aetaiReEI; (~) derive the CME currency fixing price (as a synthetic futures price}[s] from quote vendor 
spot rates and appropriate maturity forward points[; aREI (3) set IRe CMe sYrreRsy fiMiRS prise YSiRS aRy atRer 
iRfeFA'!atiaR er A'!e!RaEI EleemeEI apprepriate]. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to [&] ~ shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
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definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fixing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 

Chapter 254A 
Options on Swiss Franc Futures 

Rules 254AOO through 254A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

254A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
[13it tfaEieEI aREI]GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the [tvJe RliRYte] 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume [wl=lere availalale,] from 
[8:a8 te 9:QQ] 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If less than three or no sales (trades) occurred during the [twe RliRYie] 30-second interval noted above, take the 
midpoint of each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the [twe RliRYie] 30-
second interval. [1-iewever, .,,..l:leR leel~iRg at easl=l laiEI ! asl~ Sj3reaEI, if it is wilier ll=laR a Sj3esifieEI RYF!'IIaer ef 139iRte 
(iRj3YiteEI •tarialale, e.g., 3 139iRts fer l;;yre, 6 j3eiRte fer 8ritisl=lj39YREI, ate.), tl=leR igRere tl=lat a•terage laiel & ask 13air 
iR tl=le salsYiatieR.] 

Tier 3 [If As sales (tfaeles) aREI As laiEI aREI ask 13rises essYrreel ElYriA§ tl=le twe RliRYie iRtef\•al, tl=leR take tl=le fi\'e RliRYie 
a•terage ef sale (traEie) 13risas, weigl=lteEIIay veiYRie wl=lere a•tailalale, freRI 8:aa te 9:QQ a.RI. GeRtral till'le. 

Tier 4 If As sales (traeles) essyrreel ElYriA§ tl=le fi•Je RliAYte iRterval Retell alae\'e, take tl=le R1iE113eiRI ef easl=l laiEI & ask 
Sj3reaEI wl=lere a•.'ailalale aREI a\•erage tl=le resYIIiRg RliEI13eiRIS ever tl=le five RliRYie iRterval. 1-ie• .. ;e•;er, •NI=leR 
leel!iRg at easl=llaid ! asl~ sj3reaEI, if it is wider tl=laR a Sj3esifieEI RYF!'IIaer ef 139iRis (iR13YiteEI varialale, e.g., 3 139iRis 
fer EYre, 6 13eiRte fer 8ritisl=lj39YREI), tl=leR igRere tl=lat average laiEI & ask 13air iR tl=le salsYiatieR. 

TieH] If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the [fi•,•e miRYte] 30-second interval, then 
Exchange staff shall [take iRte seRsiEieratieR aRy etl=ler iRfeFFRatieR it Eleems a1313FS13riate te EleteFFRiRe tl=le GME 
SYFreRSY filliR!i) j3riS9 fer !l=lat !lay. Tl=lis iRfeFFRalieR may iRSIYEie. laY! is Ret liRii!eEI Ia ll=le felle•NiR!i), aREI tl=le 
13FSSeEIYres te EletermiRe tl=le iRfeFFRatieR may lae 13erfeFFReEI iR aRy erEier lay exsl=laRge staff: (1) re13eat tl=le ste13s 
ElessrilaeEI iA Tiers 3 er 4 at ever iRsreasiRg fi•;e miRYte iRsremeRis (e.g., iRteF\•als ef 1Q, 1a, 2Q, ate. miRY!es) 
YRtil Elata is elataiReEI; (2) derive the CME currency fixing price {as a synthetic futures price)[s] from quote vendor 
spot rates and appropriate maturity forward points[; aREI (3) set tl=le CME; sYrreRsy fiiEiRg 13rise YSiRg aRy etl=ler 
iRfermatieR er F!'letl=leEI EleemeEI aj313FS13riate]. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to [a] .;! shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fixing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 
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Chapter 261A 
Options on Euro Futures 

Rules 261AOO through 261A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

261A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
[pit tr=aEieEI aREI]GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the [twe miRYte] 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume [•Nf:lere availallle,] from 
[8:58 te Q:QQ] 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.rri. Central time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If less than three or no sales (trades) occurred during the [tvle miRYte] 30-second interval noted above, take the 
midpoint of each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the [tv.'e miRYte] 30-
second interval. [Plewever, wf:leR leel,iR!J at easf:llliEI .'ask spreaEI, if it is wiEier tf:laR a spesifieEI RYmller ef peiRts 
(iRpYtteEI• .. ariallle, e.!J., 3 peiRts fer eYre, 6 peiRts fer 8ritisf:l peYREI, ets.), tf:leR i!JRere tf:lat a•.•er=a!Je lliEI & asl' pair 
iR tf:le salsYiatieR.] 

Tier 3 [If Re sales (tr=aEies) aREI Re !aiEl aREI asl' prises essyrreEI EIYriR!J tf:le twa miRYte iRteF¥al, tf:leR take tf:le fi•1e miRYte 
a•leFa!Je ef sale (tr=aEie) prises, wei!Jf:lteEIIly velyme wf:lere a•lailallle, ffem 8:55 Ia Q:QQ a.m. CeRtr=al time. 

Tier 4 If Re sales (traEies) essYrreEI ElYriA!! tf:le five miRYie iRieF¥al ReteEI alaeve, take tf:le miEipeiRt ef easf:l lliEI & ask 
spreaEI wf:lere availallle aREI aver=a!Je tf:le resYIIiR!J miEipeiRts e•1er tf:le fi•le miRYie iRteF¥al. Plewe• .. er, wf:leR 
leekiR!J at easf:llliEI .'ask spreaEI, if it is wiEier tf:laR a spesifieEI RYmller ef peiRts (iRpYtteEI variallle, e.!J., 3 peiRts 
fer eYre, 6 peiRts fer 8ritisf:l peYREI), tf:leR i!JRere tf:lat avera!Je lliEI & asl' pair iR Ute salsYiatieR. 

Tier-&] If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the [fi•le miRYte] 30-second interval, then 
Exchange staff shall [take iRte seRsiEieratieR aRy etf:ler iRfeFFRatieR it Eleems apprepriate te EleteFFRiRe tf:le CMe 
BYFFeRsy filEiR!J prise fer tf:lat Elay. Tf:lis iRfeFFRatieR may iRsiYEie, llYI is Ret limiteEI te tf:le fellewiR!J, aREI tf:le 
preseEIYres te EleteFFRiRe tf:le iRfaFFRatiaR FRay lle parfeFFRaEI iR aRy arEiar lay ~6RaR!Je staff: (1) repeat tile steps 
ElessrilleEI iR Tiers 3 ar 4 at ever iRsreasiR!J fi•,<e miRYie iRsreFReRI& (e.!J., iRteF¥als af 1Q, 15, 2Q, ets. miRYtes) 
YRiil Elata is alltaiReEI; (2) derive the CME currency fixing price las a synthetic futures price)[&] from quote vendor 
spot rates and appropriate maturity forward points[; aREI (3) set tile CMe sYrreRsy filEiR!J prise Y&iR!J aRy atf:ler 
iRfeFFRatiaR ar metf:laEI EleemeEI apprepriate]. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to [a] ;I shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fixing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 
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Appendix3 

A Clean Copy of the Approved Rule Amendments to Migrate Current 2:00 PM CME FX 
Fixing Price I ·settlement Price Procedures to the 9:00 AM FX Fixing Price Procedures for 
Options on Selected FX Futures. 

Chapter 251A 
Options on British Pound Sterling Futures 

Rules 251 AOO through 251 A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

251A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are. automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out-of­
the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether an 
option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume from 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central 
time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If less than three or_no sales (trades) occurred during the 30-second interval noted above, take the midpoint of 
each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the 30-second_interval. 

Tier 3 If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the 30-second interval, then Exchange staff shall 
derive the CME currency fixing price (as a synthetic futures price) from quote vendor spot rates and appropriate 
maturity forward points. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to 3 shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for .Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). · 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fixing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 

Chapter 252A 
Options on Canadian Dollar Futures 

Rules 252AOO through 252A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

252A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume from 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central 
time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If less than three or no sales (trades) occurred during the 30-second interval noted above, take the midpoint of 
each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the 30-second interval. 

Tier 3 If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the 30-second interval, then Exchange staff shall 
derive the CME currency fixing price (as a synthetic futures price) from quote vendor spot rates and appropriate 
maturity forward points. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to 3 shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
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the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fiXing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be· exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 

Chapter 253A 
Options on Japanese Yen Futures 

Rules 253AOO through 253A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

253A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume from 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central 
time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If no sales (trades) occurred during the 30-second interval noted above, take the midpoint of each bid & ask 
spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the 30-second_interval. 

Tier 3 If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the 30-second interval, then Exchange staff shall 
derive the CME currency fixing price (as a_synthetic futures price from quote vendor spot rates and appropriate 
maturity forward points. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to 3 shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fixing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 

Chapter 254A 
Options on Swiss Franc Futures 

Rules 254AOO through 254A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

254A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. All out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: 

Tier 1 Take the 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume from 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central 
time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

Tier 2 If no sales (trades) occurred during the 30-second interval noted above, take the midpoint of each bid & ask 
spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the 30-second_interval. 

Tier 3 If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the 30-second interval, then Exchange staff shall 
derive the CME currency fixing price (as a synthetic futures price) from quote vendor spot rates and appropriate 
maturity forward points. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to 3 shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
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rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fiXing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 

Chapter 261A 
Options on Euro Futures 

Rules 261 AOO through 261 A03.A.1. are unchanged. 

261A03.A.2. Exercise of European-Style Exercise Options 

All in-the-money options are automatically exercised by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. Ali out­
of-the-money options are abandoned by the Clearing House on the day of expiration for the option. To determine whether 
an option is in or out of the money on this day, the Exchange shall calculate the relevant "CME currency fixing price" from 
GLOBEX-traded underlying futures contracts as follows: · 

Tier 1 

Tier2 

Tier3 

Take the 30-second average of sale (trade) prices, weighted by volume from 8:59:30 to 8:59:59 a.m. Central 
time on the day of determination of the CME currency fixing price. 

If less than three or_no sales (trades) occurred during the 30-second interval noted above, take the midpoint of 
each bid & ask spread where available and average the resulting midpoints over the 30-second_interval. 

If no sales (trades) and no bid and ask prices occurred during the 30-second_interval, then Exchange staff shall 
derive the CME currency fixing price (as a_synthetic futures price) from quote vendor spot rates and appropriate 
maturity forward points. 

The calculation of the CME currency fixing price at Tiers 1 to 3 shall be rounded to each contract's Price Increment's 
definition. For example, for Euro with a Price Increment of $0.0001 per Euro, the CME currency fixing price shall be 
rounded to the nearest $0.0001 per Euro (with $0.00005 and above rounded up to $0.0001, and $0.00004 and below 
rounded down to $0.0000). 

An option is in the money if the CME currency fixing price of the underlying futures contract lies above the exercise price in 
the case of a call, or lies below the exercise price in the case of a put. For example, if the CME currency fixing price were 
1.3051 or higher, then 1.3050 Calls shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or lower, 
then 1.3050 calls shall be abandoned. Similarly, if the CME currency fiXing price were 1.3049 or lower, then 1.3050 Puts 
shall be exercised. If the CME currency fixing price for Euro were 1.3050 or higher, then 1.3050 Puts shall be abandoned. 

(Remainder of rules is unchanged) 
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Appendix 4. CIIE Glo&Qt FX Futuro flldqg Priaa at I:CII All for Tier 1 and Tier 2 Calculationa for :IQ.Sec:.ONillntarval (DaMs arellantbly FX Options £Qkatioll Dates) 
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